
HEAVENLY ESCAPE IN BODRUM 

Located in a secluded paradise in Tilkicik Bay, Yalıkavak, Bodrum, this property 
seamlessly blends into the natural beauty of its surroundings, offering an unparalleled 
luxury experience from sunrise to sunset. If I were to name places that must be seen 
in a lifetime, exploring the shores of Turkey’s crystal-clear seas would be at the top of 
my list. The homeowner, Rose H. Bilge and her husband, share this passion to the 
fullest. Enchanted by Bodrum’s Tilkicik Bay, They transformed this serene oasis into 
their personal paradise. 

The inspiration behind this haven stems from their longing for the sun, warm weather, 
azure sea, and lush nature during their time abroad. Driven by this yearning, they 
chose a vast 1,000-square-meter plot in Tilkicik Bay, Yalıkavak, and embarked on a 
project.  They worked together with luxury  lifestyle brand creator and curator Selin 
Persentili Aral of SP Branding and created their brand named Rose Beach 
Garden—a luxurious villa featuring a remarkable collection of 28 art pieces. 
Sustainability was a fundamental principle in its architectural design, making solar 
energy, harnessed from natural resources, the lifeblood of the villa. 

The four-story villa consists of two partially connected structures with terrace 
gardens. The ground floor of the main building houses two living rooms, two kitchens, 
and pantries. The second and third floors feature seven luxurious en-suite bedrooms, 
each with a breathtaking sea-view balcony. Committed to an eco-conscious lifestyle, 
has chosen sustainably sourced organic sun towels from 3rd Culture for the villa’s 
wet areas. 

A lover of hosting friends and eager to create an experience that rivals hotel comfort, 
the homeowner collaborated with Selin Persentili Aral to reflect their vision of 
eco-conscious lifestyle featuring sustainably sourced brands. As a result as a part of 
her team, The villa’s unique and meticulously curated interior design was brought to 
life in partnership with Bodrum Nomads. The tranquil atmosphere, enriched by 
Homemade Aromatherapy’s natural products, is further elevated by 3rd Culture’s 
vibrant patterns and colors, Yastık by Rıfat Özbek’s exclusive cushion collections, 
and some of the artworks from Galeri Bosfor. 

The curation of a 28-piece art collection, featuring works by Leyla Pekmen, Uğur 
Daştan, Olgu Ülkenciler, Ahmet Çerkez, Ilgın Seymen, and İpek Yücesoy, was 
created for the art enthusiast homeowners by Selin Persentili Aral and Göksen 
Buğra. 

The villa’s lush garden, adorned with towering palm trees, seamlessly integrates with 
the expansive horizon view. A jet-powered saltwater pool, offering a breathtaking 
panorama at every hour of the day, enhances the joy of outdoor living. The carefully 
designed layout—from the landscaped garden to the rooftop terrace—also creates 
an ideal setting for meditation, yoga, and personal wellness sessions. 

With sunlit verandas, waterfront decks, and cozy fire pits, every detail of Rose Beach 
Garden has been meticulously thought and crafted by the homeowners to provide 
relaxation and togetherness in a serene atmosphere. 



Nestled in the secluded paradise of Tilkicik Bay, Yalıkavak, Rose Beach Garden 
effortlessly embodies luxury, blending it with nature’s ever-changing beauty 
throughout the day. From sunrise to sunset, this hidden gem offers its residents a 
unique sense of peace and elegance, making every moment an unforgettable 
experience. 


